NIESC BAKERY BID

Alfred Nickles Bakery, Inc-withdrew bid based on distribution
change to Aunt Millies-Aunt Millies is honoring Nickle's

NIESC BAKERY BID
JULY 1, 2011-JUNE 30, 2012

Perfection Bakeries (DBA Aunt Millie's Bakeries)-Winning Vendor

Hostess Brands-NO AWARD-NOT ENOUGH PRODU(

- - ] limited delivery options
2011-2012 products/pricing on the bid. yop
NIESC PRODUCT | VENDOR ALT VENDOR ALT VENDOR ALT
ESTQTY:| ITEM |DESCRIPTION/| ITEM PlFerl\IcltTE' DESCRIPTION/ PQ:‘CTE_ PCE%SFT/Sj_ COMMENTS: ITEM Plé’;'(':TE_ DESCRIPTION/P PQ:EZTE' ;E?QSFT/S@_ COMMENTS: ITEM Plé’;'(':TE_ DESCRIPTION/ PQ:EZTE' SE%SFT/;\?
NUMBER: | PACKAGING: | NUMBER: : PKG: : : NUMBER: : KG: : : NUMBER: : PKG: : :
L Lb. French French bread loaf
423 Bl Bread Loaf, 1313 $1.46 7523 000 $1.43 $0.07 200z loaf, sliced NO BID
sliced
2250 B2 1 0z. Bread 1744 $2.32 5080 5inch bread stick| ~ $5.22 $0.15 3602/36¢t NO BID
Stick (24 count)
100% Whole 16 0z 100%
953 B3 Wheat Bread, 1290 Whole Wheat | $1.30 336 $1.24 $0.05 45000-12100 | $2.15 | 16 OZ. LOAF
24 oz. loaf Bread
12 Grain
378 B4 Country Style 1239 $1.58 1797 12 Grain Hearth | = ¢ g4 $0.08 240z/13slices 45000-11178 | $2.95 | 24 OZ LOAF
Bread, (17- bread
1.10z. slices)
112 B5 12in. Ft. Long 1513 $2.35 7688 Footlongbuns | ¢, gq $0.09 180z/6ct package NO BID
Bun 8 ct 6et
4 in. Bulk Whole
25 B6 Grain 1766 4 Whole Grain | ¢, 4q 3480 | $3.25 $0.06 5602/30ct NO BID
Hamburger Buns| Hamb Bun
30 ct.
6 in. Whole #1980 Whole
25 B7 Grain Sub B ot eran12o e | $238 5157 $1.43 $0.08 190z/8ct - 5 1/2 NO BID
6 in. Whole
13478 B8 |ginsubizc| 1980 $2.38 NO BID NO BID
6.in Sesame
447 B9 Steak Bun, 1769 $3.82 4402 $2.73 $0.04 640z/24ct 45000-60606 | $2.15 | 18 OZ PKG./6
' COUNT
sliced, 24 count
8 in. Bread . ’ 15 0Z. PKG./8
8475 B10 Sticks (2 back) 1616 $1.06 5002 8inch bread stick|  $3.32 $0.09 3502z/24ct 45000-14025 | $1.86 COUNT
682 gz |81 S”cl: Bun.61  1g26 $1.36 4753 $1.29 $0.08 170z/6¢t NO BID
Bagel, plain and | 188-189-190- 6945, 6944, Multi-Grain, Brown
167 B12 flavored (6 pack)| 191-192 Ll 6943 $1.79 Sugar, White with WG NOBID
Country Style
100 B13 Nine Grain 1268 $2.18 1909 $1.90 $0.08 2402/15slices 45000-11172 | $2.95 | 24 OZ LOAF/
MULTI GRAIN
Bread, 240z.
Country Style
25 B14 Swiss Multi- 1264 $2.18 514 $2.30 NO BID
Grain Bread,
240z.
753 gis | Delilaian Split] o, $1.65 NO BID NO BID
Bun 8 ct.
Diamond Jim
1973 B16 Buns (2.3 oz. 1515 $1.30 4339 $1.28 $0.07 190z/8ct 45000-11282 | $2.08 | 16 0% PKG.76
COUNT
per bun, 8 pack)
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change to Aunt Millies-Aunt Millies is honoring Nickle's
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952

B17

Dinner Rolls,
Wheat
(enriched, 2 oz.
Doz. pack)

1649

$1.68

5320

$2.10

$0.09

240z/12ct

NO BID

737

B18

Dinner Rolls,
White (enriched,
2 0z. 24-pack)

1655

$1.95

(larger 0z)

4389

$2.06

White dinner rolls
- 1.330z each

only 1.33
oz

$0.06

3202z/24ct - 1.330z each

45000-41162

$1.86

13 0OZ. PKG./ 10
COUNT

85

B19

Dinner Rolls,
White,
individually
wrapped, 12
count

1830

$2.48

NO BID

NO BID

135

B20

Dt Fair Donuts
15 ct

3215

$1.85

NO BID

NO BID

380

B21

French Bread,
unsliced, 22.in
loaf

1093

$1.58

7549

$1.43

$0.07

200z loaf

NO BID

145

B22

French Dinner
Roll, white
dough, 12 ct.

1540

$1.84

NO BID

NO BID

25

B23

Golden Flax &
Grain Bread,
240z.

1273

$2.18

NO BID

45000-11244

$2.95

24 OZ. LOAF

15

B24

Hamburger
Buns, 4 in.,
seeded, 30 ct.

1716

$3.80

4020

$2.98

$0.10

6302/30ct

NO BID

31033

B25

Hamburger
Buns, Wheat
(enriched, 4 in.,
12-pack)

1766

$1.40

3159

$1.30

$0.06

230z/12ct

45000-11103

$1.86

12 0Z. PKG./8
COUNT

18325

B26

Hamburger
Buns, White
(enriched, 3.5
in., Doz. pack)

1502

$1.12

3124

$1.19

$0.07

180z/12ct

45000-11149

$1.62

12 OZ. PKG. /12
COUNT

5372

B27

Hamburger
Buns, White
(enriched, 4 in.,
Bulk pack)

1691 60
count

$5.83

4012

$2.86

$0.10

6302/30ct

45000-12882

$1.60

24 0Z., PKG./
16 COUNT

35620

B28

Hamburger
Buns, White
(enriched, 4 in.,
Doz. pack)

1524

$1.17

3136

$1.15

$0.10

230z/12ct

45000-11145

$2.08

21 0Z.PKG./12
COUNT

34327

B29

Hamburger
Buns, Whole
Grain White, 8
ct.

1793

$0.94

NO BID

NO BID




NIESC BAKERY BID

Alfred Nickles Bakery, Inc-withdrew bid based on distribution
change to Aunt Millies-Aunt Millies is honoring Nickle's
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NIESC PRODUCT VENDOR ALT VENDOR ALT VENDOR ALT
EST QTY: ITEM DESCRIPTION/ ITEM PlFJJI\Icl:TE DESCRIPTION/ PQILCTE' PCE(?{SIT'I'/I?I\i COMMENTS: ITEM PlFJJI\I(I:TE DESCRIPTION/P PQ:EZTE' ;:E(;{SIT'I'/I(EDI\i COMMENTS: ITEM PlFJJI\I(lj-:—E DESCRIPTION/ PQ:EZTE' ;:Ec;es;r‘r/é)hi
NUMBER: [ PACKAGING: | NUMBER: ) PKG: ) ) NUMBER: ) KG: ) ) NUMBER: ) PKG: ) )
Hawaiian Dinner
377 B30 Roll-12 ct/24 NO BID 4393 $2.10 $0.09 240z/12ct NO BID
0z..
Hoagie Buns, -
9808 B31 White (enriched, | 1522-1575 $1.91 4339 AM Mini Sub $1.28 $0.07 190z/8ct 45000-60607 | $2.15 180Z. PKG./6
. buns 8ct COUNT
6 in., Doz. pack)
Honey Cr.
95 gz | WheatBread- 1050 $1.58 221 $1.24 2402/20slice NO BID
thick sliced, 18
slices
Honey
Hamburger 21 0Z.PKG./12
592 B33 Buns, 3 1/2.in. 1565 $1.46 3337 $1.40 $0.06 240z/12ct 45000-60057 | $2.08 COUNT
12-pack
Hot Dog Buns,
22775 B34 White (enriched, 1509 $1.16 3162 $1.15 $0.06 180z/12ct 45000-13035 | $2.08 170Z.PKG. /12
. COUNT
6 in., Doz. pack)
Hot Dog Buns, .
3553 B35  |White (enriched,| 1512 $1.64 4169 9inchfootlong | ¢ gq $0.12 140z/6ct 45000-11281 | $1.86 | 12 0% PKG./8
. hot dog bun COUNT
9-12 in., 8 pack)
Hot Dog Buns .
S Whole Grain hot 12 OZ. PKG./8
15080 B36 Wholec(tBraln, 8 1794 $0.94 2918 dog buns 12ct $1.30 $0.11 180z/12ct 45000-11318 | $2.01 COUNT
Hot Dog Bun- Whole Grain hot 12 OZ. PKG./8
18100 B37 Wheat 8 ct. 1817 $1.25 2918 dog buns 12ct $1.30 $0.11 180z/12ct 45000-11102 | $1.86 COUNT
Indvd. Wrapped
Whole Grain
Flavored
Muffins, 1.8 oz., 2479, 2483, ’
25 B38 include brownie, NO BID 2493, 2502 $2.10 $0.19 6ct - ind wrap package NO BID
choc. chip,
coffee cake &
blueberry
Italian Pan
92 B39 Bread 20 oz.- 1087 $1.61 328 $1.24 $0.05 2402/20slice NO BID
sliced
Multi-Grain 4 in Multi-Grain 18 OZ. PKG. /8
1754 B40 Kaiser Bun 8 ct. 1854 $1.41 3159 hamburger - 4 $1.30 $0.06 230z/12ct 45000-60608 | $2.15 COUNT
Sausage Buns Minu sub buns -
107 B41 12 ct.-5in non- 1951 $2.15 4339 8ct $1.28 $0.07 190z/8ct NO BID
seeded, hinged
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415

B42

Small Sliced
Wheat Bun
Square Cluster,
1.3 0z. ea. 16 ct.

N/A

Uncliced Whole

4382 Grain dinner rolls

$2.12 $0.07 320z/24ct

NO BID

1110

B43

Small Sliced
White Dinner
Roll-1.3 0z. 24

ct.

1694

Small sliced
White Dinner
Roll 12 ct.

$1.16

5212 $2.06 $0.06 320z/24ct

45000-11169

$1.86

12 OZ. PKG. /12
COUNT

5377

B44

Snowflake
Dinner Rolls,
Square Cluster,
1.3 0z. ea. 12 ct.

1661

$1.16

NO BID

NO BID

475

B45

Soft Dinner Roll,
yellow dough, 12
ct.

1544

$2.25

NO BID

NO BID

7122

B46

Split Top 8-Grain
Dinner Rolls,
(1.2 0z. ea., 16
pack)

1966

$1.61

NO BID

NO BID

4408

B47

Split Top Honey
Dinner Rolls,
(1.2 0z. ea, 16
pack)

1964

$1.61

NO BID

NO BID

3890

B48

Texas Toast,
white or yellow
1.in slice (1 1/2

1b.)

1091Yellow -
1041 White

$1.32

369 $1.23 $0.06 220z/16slices

45000-20099

$2.15

24 OZ. LOAF

4552

B49

Wheat
Sandwich Bread,
enriched, 1 oz.
slices, 24 pack

1322

$1.23

466 $1.19 $0.05 220z/24slices - loaf

NO BID

2437

B50

Wheat, SG,
Restaurant
Sandwich,
enriched, 32 sl.,
24 oz.

1012

$1.23

466 $1.19 $0.05 220z/24slices - loaf

45000-13201

$2.15

24 OZ. LOAF

230

B51

White Bread w/
Whole Grain 24
0z-24 slices

1059

#1059 20 oz.
White Whole
Grain

$1.30

20 oz. 20 slice

136 $2.10

NO BID

1092

B52

White Bread, 20
oz. loaf, 20
slices per loaf

1006

$1.10

131 $1.15 $0.05 240z/24slices

45000-11003

$1.86

20 OZ. LOAF

412

B53

White English
Muffins-12 ct/24
0z.

557

white English
Muffins 6 ct.#557

$1.61

6 count English
Muffin

2395 $1.96 240z/12ct

45000-11501

$1.72

12 0Z. PKG./6
COUNT




NIESC BAKERY BID

Alfred Nickles Bakery, Inc-withdrew bid based on distribution
change to Aunt Millies-Aunt Millies is honoring Nickle's

NIESC BAKERY BID

JULY 1, 2011-JUNE 30, 2012

Perfection Bakeries (DBA Aunt Millie's Bakeries)-Winning Vendor

Hostess Brands-NO AWARD-NOT ENOUGH PRODU(

- L . limited delivery options
2011-2012 products/pricing on the bid. yop
NIESC PRODUCT VENDOR ALT VENDOR ALT VENDOR ALT
EST QTY: ITEM DESCRIPTION/ ITEM Pléll\lclg_ DESCRIPTION/ PQ:‘CTE_ PCE%SFT/S,\? COMMENTS: ITEM Plé’;‘ég_ DESCRIPTION/P PQ:E:TE_ ;:E%SFT/S,\?_ COMMENTS: ITEM Pléll\lgz_ DESCRIPTION/ PQ:E:TE_ ;:E%SFT/S&_
NUMBER: | PACKAGING: | NUMBER: ) PKG: ) ) NUMBER: ) KG: ) ) NUMBER: ) PKG: ) )
White
Restaurant
8130 B54 Sandwich, 1008 $1.23 157 $1.19 $0.05 220z/24slices - loaf | 45000-13800 | $1.70 | 32 OZ. LOAF
enriched, 32
slices, 24 oz.
White Sandwich
7642 gss |Bread emiched | g7 $1.23 157 $1.19 $0.05 220z/24slices - loaf | 45000-11054 | $2.15 | 24 OZ. LOAF
1 oz. slices, 24
pack
Whole Grain Whole Grain
30180 B56 Dinner Rolls 16 1975 $1.61 4382 . $2.12 $0.07 320z/24ct NO BID
ot dinner rolls 24ct
Whole Grain Whole Grain Mini
113 B57 Steak BUN-12 ct. 1980 $2.38 5157 Sub 8ct $1.43 $0.08 190z/8ct NO BID
Whole Grain Whole Grain
12733 B58 White Bread (20 1059 $1.30 380 A $1.24 $0.05 240z/20slices 45000-11224 | $2.15 | 20 OZ. LOAF
) White bread 240z
0z., 22 slice)
Whole Wheat
25 B59 English Muffin NO BID 2206 $1.20 NO BID
12 0z./6 ct.
TOTALS
WIO ALT. $87.44 $47.59 $56.04
ALT
TOTALS: $9.23 $37.00 — $0.00
GRAND AUNT MILLIES DID NOT BID ON 11 ITEMS
TOTALS W/ $96.67 $84.59
ALTS.
NICKLES- AUNT,
MILLIE'S
PRICING EEIEING
TOTAL 22 37
TOTAL
ENS ITEMS
AWARDED

AWARDED:




NIESC BAKERY BID
JULY 1, 2011-JUNE 30, 2012

CT AVAILABLE

COMMENTS:

WONDER

NATURES
PRIDE

HOME PRIDE

BREAD DU
JOUR

NATURES
PRIDE

NATURES
PRIDE



CT AVAILABLE

COMMENTS:

WONDER

NATURES
PRIDE

WONDER

WONDER

WONDER

WONDER 4

NIESC BAKERY BID
JULY 1, 2011-JUNE 30, 2012



NIESC BAKERY BID
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CT AVAILABLE

COMMENTS:

HOME PRIDE 7

WONDER 4

WONDER

WONDER

WONDER

WONDER

HOME PRIDE
CORNMEAL
KAISER



NIESC BAKERY BID
JULY 1, 2011-JUNE 30, 2012

CT AVAILABLE
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WONDER

WONDER

WONDER

WONDER

WONDER



CT AVAILABLE

COMMENTS:

WONDER

WONDER

WONDER
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10



	NIESC Bakery Bid 2011-2012

